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Audit 707 SE Quincy Street, Suite 319

Topeka, Kansas 66603

‘“l“ﬁ"i Fin ance Ph. 785.251.4212

Question 1:

Answer 1:
Question 2:

Answer 2:

Email: auditfinance@snco.us

Addendum 1
RFP 001-26
Inmate Clothing, Hygiene, and other items
01/05/2026

Response to Bid Portal Questions

Can you please advise who was awarded these items before and at what price? / Do you have last
years awarded pricing?

Last year’s award is attached.
Do you have a usage report?

We do not have a usage report.



Tabulation

RFP: 071-24 Clothing Items
Closed 01/07/2025

4.5|Work Jeans 46x34 $ 9.88 $ 27.50
4.5|Work Jeans 46x36 No Bid $§ 27.50

Item Size Acme Barker Charm C Health ICS Pacific Pyramid Shoes Victory
5.1|Boxer Short, white SM - XL $ 0871% 1.14 1358 12.751% 1.07 [NoBid |NoBid $ 0.93
5.1|Boxer Short, white 2 XL $ 1.10 [ § 0871% 1.14 13518 1285(% 1.13 $ 0.93
5.1|Boxer Short, white 3 XL $ 1.10 | $ 1.08 % 1.20 1421 ¢ 1465(8% 1.18 $ 0.98
5.1|Boxer Short, white 4 XL $ 1.10 | $ 1.08|$ 1.24 142§ 1565|138 1.24 $ 0.99
5.1|Boxer Short, white 6 XL $ 1.10 | $ 1.17($ 1.29 6.091$ 17.78$ 1.35 $ 1.02
6.1|Boxer Short, white 7 XL $ 1.10 | § isfam §  1.39 6.0918 18.15[8% 1.46 $ 1.18
5.1|Boxer Short, white 8 XL $ 1.10 | § 12518 149 809§ 1936|% 1.58 $ 1.18

Item Size Acme Barker Charm C Health ICS Pacific Pyramid Shoes Victory
5.2|Panties, white 5 $ 1.00 | $ 0.58 % 0.79 |NoBid $ 1050|$ 0.85|NoBid |No Bid $ 0.59
5.2|Panties, white 6 $ 1.00 [ $ 0581% 0.79 $ 1050|% 0.85 $ 0.59
5.2|Panties, white q $ 1.00 | $ 0588 0.79 $ 1050]|%8 0.85 $ 0.59
5.2|Panties, white 8 $ 1.00 | § 0588 0.79 $§ 1050]|$ 0.85 $ 0.59
5.2|Panties, white 9 $ 1.00 | $ 0678 0.89 § 124518 0.98 $ 0.65
5.2|Panties, white 10 $ 1.00 | $ 067($ 0.89 $ 1245|% 0.98 $ 0.65
5.2|Panties, white 11 $ 1.00 | $ 067 % 0.99 $ 14303 1.13 $ 0.68
5.2|Panties, white 12 $ 1.00 | § 0.67[8% 0.99 $§ 1430|$ 1.13 $ 0.68
5.2|Panties, white 13 $ 1.00 | $ 080 [$§ 0.9 § 152518 1.24 $ 0.68
5.2|Panties, white 14 $ 1.00 | $ 0.80|% 0.99 $ 15258 124 $ (572

Item Size Acme Barker Charm C Health ICS Pacific Pyramid Shoes Victory
5.3|Sports Bra, white S/34 $ 2.00 | $ 138 |$ 1.72 [NoBid $§ 2585|% 2.05[NoBid |NoBid $ 1.41
5.3|Sports Bra, white M/36 $ 2.00 | $ 13818 1.72 $§ 2585|% 2.05 $ 1.41
5.3|Sports Bra, white L/38 $ 2.00 | $ 13818 1.72 $§ 2585|% 2.05 $ 1.41
5.3|Sports Bra, white XL/40 $ 2.00 | $ 13818 1.72 § 2585|% 2.05 $ 1.47
5.3|Sports Bra, white 2X/42 $ 2.00 | $ 13818 1.72 § 28.15]|% 230 $ 1.47
5.3|Sports Bra, white 3X/44 $ 2.00 | $ 146 | § 1.72 § 2815|838 230 $ 1.66




RFP: 071-24 Clothing Items Tabulation
Closed 01/07/2025
5.3|Sports Bra, white 4X/46 $ 2.00 [ § 146 | § 1.84 $ 3065|% 2.50 $ 1.66
5.3|Sports Bra, white 5X/48 $ 2.00 | $ 16718 1.84 $ 3065|8 2.50 $ 1.66
5.3|Sports Bra, white 6X/50 $ 2.00 [ $ 17518 1.84 $§ 3458 |% 275 $ 1.66
5.3|Sports Bra, white 7X/52 $ 2.00 | $ 17518 1.84 $ 3458 |% 275 $ 1.66
Item Size Acme Barker Charm C Health ICS Pacific Pyramid Shoes Victory
5.4{Socks, tube, grey one size $ 050 | $ 0.38 [ $ 0.49 [NoBid $ 61518 047 1.99|No Bid $ 0.42
5.4|Socks, Gray Wold Blend/Coljone size No Bid No Bid Sl NoBid | NoBid | NoBid [No Bid No Bid
5.4|Socks, ankle, white one size $ 044 | % 04618 0.49 $ 578 |% 0.44 [NoBid |NoBid $ 0.40
Item Size Acme Barker Charm C Health 1CS Pacific Pyramid Shoes Victory
6.1|Boots 8 No Bid $ 22.50 | No Bid NoBid |[$ 30.78 | $ 33.50 | No Bid 4899 § 23.74
6.1|Boots 9 $ 227550 $ 30.78 | $ 33.50 48.99( § 23.74
6.1|Boots 10 $ 22.50 $ 30.78 | $ 33.50 48.991 § 23.74
6.1|Boots 11 $ 2250 $ 30.78 | $ 33.50 48.99| § 23.74
6.1|Boots 12 $ 23.50 $ 30.78 % 33.50 48.99( § 23.74
6.1|Boots 13 $ 23.50 $ 30.78|$ 33.50 48.99| § 23.74
6.1|Boots 14 $ 23.50 $ 30.78 | § 33.50 48.991 § 23.74
Item Size Acme Barker Charm C Health ICS Pacific Pyramid Shoes Victory
6.2|EVA Step-In Shoe, orange [SM - XL No Bid $ 325|9% 3.87 |[NoBid $ 8.06|% 800 |NoBid |NoBid $ 3.79
6.2|EVA Step-In Shoe, orange |2 XL $ 365| % 3.87 $ 8.06|% 8.00 $ 3.79
6.2|EVA Step-In Shoe, orange |3 XL $ 47518 3.87 $ 806|% 8.00 $ 3.79
Item Size Acme Barker Charm C Health ICS Pacific Pyramid Shoes Victory
6.3 |[Rubber Slip On Boots 7 No Bid No Bid $ 119.90 |No Bid $ 21.85 | NoBid [NoBid |NoBid $ W600
6.3|Rubber Slip On Boots 8 $ 119.90 § 21.85 $ 16.09
6.3|Rubber Slip On Boots 9 $ 119.90 $§ 21.85 $§ 16.09
6.3|Rubber Slip On Boots 10 $ 119.90 $ 21.85 $ 16.09
6.3|Rubber Slip On Boots 11 $ 119.90 $§ 21.85 $ 16.09
6.3|Rubber Slip On Boots 12 $ 119.90 $§ 21.85 $§ 16.09
6.3|Rubber Slip On Boots 13 $ 119.90 $ 21.85 $ 16.09




RFP: 071-24 Clothing Items Tabulation
Closed 01/07/2025
6.3|Rubber Slip On Boots 14 $ 119.90 $ 21.85 § 16.09
Item Size Acme Barker Charm C Health ICS Pacific Pyramid Shoes Victory
6.4|Economy Boot 7 No Bid $ 16.99 |No Bid No Bid $ 30.78 | NoBid | NoBid 45491 § 14.89
6.4|Economy Boot 8 $ 16.99 $ 30.78 45491 § 14.89
6.4|Economy Boot 9 $ 16.99 $ 30.78 45.49|8 14.89
6.4|Economy Boot 10 $ 16.99 $ 30.78 45491 § 14.89
6.4|Economy Boot 11 $ 16.99 $ 30.78 45.49|% 14.89
6.4|Economy Boot 12 $ 16.99 $ 30.78 45491 $ 14.89
6.4|Economy Boot 13 $ 16.99 $ 30.78 45491 $ 14.89
6.4|Economy Boot 14 $ 16.99 $ 30.78 45.49( § 14.89
Item Size Acme Barker Charm C Health ICS Pacific Pyramid Shoes Victory
7.1|Baseball cap, kelly green one size No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 3729 | NoBid [NoBid |NoBid No Bid
7.1|Baseball cap, orange one size $ 2.46 |No Bid $ 37.29 | No Bid $ 2.21
7.2|Knit Watch Cap, orange one size $ 1.14 1§ 15.18 § 1558 1% 1.10 $ 1.31
Item Size Acme Barker Charm C Health ICS Pacific Pyramid Shoes Victory
7.3|Gloves, leather palm one size No Bid No Bid $ 28.90 [No Bid NoBid |[NoBid |NoBid [No Bid No Bid
7.4|Gloves, jersey one size No Bid $ 0.83 | $ 14.90 |No Bid NoBid | NoBid |NoBid [No Bid No Bid




RFP: 071-24 Miscellaneous Items Tabulation
Closed 01/07/2025
£
g b =] § -;3 3] E t,
z o) %: = g S %) % g =
) g = <= = 2 &) 3 > 2
No. |Item < < A O &) = = &~ A~ =
1|Blanket, Security |NoBid |No Bid $ 5098 |$ 63.54 [NoBid [No Bid 103.50 [ NoBid | No Bid 51.44
2|Blanket, Polyester [No Bid 599|$ 550 |$ 6.72 |NoBid $ 485 9.35 | NoBid [NoBid [No Bid
Mattress with built- }) 0
in Pillow, security J(l’ﬂm
3|clear No Bid  |No Bid $ 9594 |$ 88.72 [NoBid |No Bid 61.54 | No Bid | No Bid 91.98
4|Smock, security No Bid |No Bid $ 63.50 |$ 63.54 |No Bid No Bid 128.68 | No Bid No Bid 54.98
5|Towel $§ 9.000 § 075 § W% 1098 [ $§ 1.26/$ 7.10 12.15($ 1075|8$ 1798 0.88
7
6|Washcloth, white $ 280 $ 017] $ 1.75|% 217 $ 238§ 1.25 27818 125]|% 4.68 0.16
7|Washcloth, brown | $ 5.000 § 027 § 3.95|$ 3.53 [NoBid § 199 34618 280|% 4.68 0.24
8|Sheets $ 24.000 § 200/ $§ 28.40/F 26.18 [No Bid $§ 21.95 33.65| % 46.75 | No Bid 2.14
9|Pencil, golf No Bid  [No Bid $ 6.19[% 7.18NoBid [NoBid 510 % 121.50 | §  4.99 |No Bid
10(Pencil, security No Bid |No Bid $ 9.68|% 18.18 |NoBid |NoBid 38.05 [ NoBid | NoBid |NoBid




RFP: 071-24 Miscellaneous Items

Closed 01/07/2025
11|Pen, security NoBid [No Bid 9.14|$ 18.18 [NoBid |No Bid $ 18.45|$ 200.85 [ NoBid [No Bid
12|Basketball NoBid [No Bid 89519% 16.89 [NoBid |NoBid $ 10.78 [ NoBid [$ 5.99 [No Bid
15[Playing cards No Bid  |No Bid 8.28 | $ 13.90 [NoBid [NoBid $ 890|$ 96.70 | NoBid [NoBid
16|Chess NoBid |[No Bid 499 |$ 4490 [NoBid |NoBid $ 445|NoBid |NoBid |NoBid
17[Checkers No Bid No Bid 459 |% 44.90 [No Bid No Bid $§ 3.78 | No Bid No Bid |No Bid
21|Dominos No Bid [No Bid 69.50 | $§ 49.90 [NoBid |No Bid $ 525|NoBid |NoBid [NoBid
23|Laundry Soap, ALI{No Bid  [No Bid 8531 1% 89.98 [NoBid |No Bid NoBid |NoBid |$ 69.98 [No Bid
24|TranzPort Hood [No Bid No Bid 899 |% 88.90 |No Bid No Bid $§ 27.40 | No Bid No Bid |No Bid

Tabulation




RFP: 071-24 Personal Hygene Items Tabulation
Closed 01/07/2025
No.|Item Barker Charm C Health (Got It ICS Pacific | Phoenix | Pyramid | Unipak
1|/Comb $ 4494 | $ 5490 | $§ 36.23 INB $ 47.18|% 44.00|$ 5.04 | NoBid No Bid
2|Femine Hygene Pads $ 27.70 |83 52.90 | NB $ 095|$ 51.65|8 4925(% 28.75|% 49.98 | No Bid
3|Disposal Bags $ 3891 1| $ 38.90 | NB NB $ 3359[% 29.75(% 3999|$ 19.99 | No Bid
4|Razor $ 30.58 [ $ 57.90 | $ 150.00 | NB $ 66.05|% 6920 |$ 70.00 | NoBid No Bid
5|Electric Hair Clippers $ 89.75 | $ 69.90 | NB NB NB NB $ 134.51 | No Bid No Bid
6|Soap, Bar $ 45.11 | $ 3990 [ § 116.68 | NB $§ 51.78|$% 62.50$ 52.00 | NoBid No Bid
7|Soap, indv. packet $ 39.00 [ $ 44901 $ 60.00 | NB $ 60.75]1% 29.10|$ 55.00 | NoBid No Bid
8| Toothbrush, security $ 1047 | $ 990 | $ 106.25 | NB $ 84518 53.60|$ 8.64 | No Bid No Bid
9|Toothbrush, short handle | $ 540 | $ 6.54 | $ 149.50 | NB $ 810§ 7580|% 9.36 | NoBid No Bid
10| Toothpaste $ 2430 | $ 21.54 | $ 128.21 | NB $ 28408 136.10|$ 33.12 | No Bid No Bid




RFP: 071-24 Personal Hygene Items Tabulation

Closed 01/07/2025

No.|Item Barker Charm C Health |(Got It ICS Pacific | Phoenix | Pyramid | Unipak
11 [Finger nail clippers $ 9.87 | $ 99018 7578 | NB $§ 2858 6525[% 12.96 | NoBid No Bid
12|Toe nail clipper $ 730 ]S 9.54 |18 7652 | NB $ 6.151% 6930 |8$ 10.68 | No Bid No Bid
14|Disposable Briefs, regular | $ 128.40 | $ 146.90 | NB NB $ 29938 |8 12.05[NoBid |$ 17.99 | NoBid
15[Disposable Briefs, x1 $ 114.40 | $ 124.90 | NB NB $ 27658 [$ 12.05|NoBid [$ 22.89 | NoBid
16(Nitirle Gloves, sm - $ 99.70 | $ 4690 [$ 87.10 | NB $ 59.05|% 39.15]| NoBid $ 399 [ $ 38.90
17|Nitirle Gloves, md $ 997 | $ 46.90 [ § 87.10 | NB $ 59.05[8% 39.15| NoBid $ 3.99 | § 38.90
18|Nitirle Gloves, Ig $ 9.97 | $ 4690 | $ 87.10 | NB $§ 59.05[$ 39.15 | NoBid $ 3.99 | $ 38.90
19|Nitirle Gloves, xI $ 9.97 | $ 46.90 | § 87.10 | NB $ 59.05|8$ 39.15 | NoBid $ 3.99 | § 38.90
20(Deodorant, .50z $ 5799 | $ 39.18 | $ 193.15 | NB $ 4638 |$ 22270 | $ 50.40 | No Bid No Bid
21|Deodorant, 2.250z $ 4492 1 % 94.90 [ NB NB $ 119.05[$ 217.75|$ 180.00 | No Bid No Bid




RFP: 071-24 Clothing Items Tabulation
Closed 01/07/2025
Item Coveralls Size Acme Barker Charm | C Health | ICS Pacific | Pyramid | Shoes Victory
1.1|Coveralls, snap MD - XL $§ 1344 (S 15.85|$ 14.90 |NoBid $ 2638 |% 16.20 [NoBid [NoBid $ 1454
1.1|Coveralls, snap 2 XL $ 1344(8$ 16.60 | $§ 14.90 $ 2638 |8% 16.55 $ 14.54
1.1|Coveralls, snap 4 XL $ 1344189 16.60 | $ 16.54 $ 2883|% 17.90 $§ 1526
1.1|Coveralls, snap 6 XL $ 13448 18.65| 8 17.72 $ 32.00|% 19.25 $§ 16.00
1.1|Coveralls, snap 8 XL $§ 134418 20.80 [ $§ 20.54 $ 34.00 | NB $§ 16.73
1.1|Coveralls, snap 10 XL $§ 1344 |% 20.80 [ $ 20.90 $ 44.00 | NB $ 17.46
Available Colors: Navy X X X X X X
Gray X X X X X
Green X X X X X
Lt Blue X X X X
Yellow X X X X X
Orange X X X X X X
Tan X X X X X
Brown X X X X X
Item Size Acme Barker Charm C Health ICS Pacific Pyramid Shoes Victory
1.2|V-Neck Work shirt, gold MD - XL No Bid No Bid $ 6.54 [NoBid $ 13.82 | NoBid |NoBid |[NoBid |[§ 6.13
1.2|V-Neck Work shirt, gold 2 XL $ 654 $§ 13.82 $ 6.13
1.2|V-Neck Work shirt, gold 4 XL $§ 672 $ 1498 $ 6.77
1.2|V-Neck Work shirt, gold 6 XL $§ 7.99 $ 16.28 $ 7.40
1.2|V-Neck Work shirt, gold 8 XL § 8.54 $ 21.00 $ el
Item Size Acme Barker Charm C Health ICS Pacific Pyramid Shoes Victory
2.1|Coat, denim blue or orange |SM - XL $§ 2500(8$ 20.50 | $ 20.90 [No Bid $ 64.00 [NoBid [NoBid |NoBid $ 16.50
2.1|Coat, denim blue or orange |2 XL $§ 25008 20.50 | $ 21.90 $ 64.00 $§ 1691
2.1|Coat, denim blue or orange |3 XL $§ 2500 (S 20.50 | $ 22.90 $ 66.00 $ 1743
2.1|Coat, denim blue or orange |4 XL $§ 25.00(8$ 20.50 | $ 22.90 $ 68.00 SRS
2.1|Coat, denim blue or orange |5 XL $ 2500189 20.50 | $ 23.90 $ 70.00 $ 17.95
2.1|Coat, denim blue or orange |6 XL $ 2500189 20.50 | $ 24.90 $ 72.00 $ 17.95




RFP: 071-24 Clothing Items Tabulation
Closed 01/07/2025

Ttem Size Acme Barker Charm CHealth |ICS Pacific Pyramid Shoes Victory
3.1|T-Shirt, safety green SM - XL No Bid No Bid NoBid |NoBid |[$ 10.05|NoBid |[NoBid |NoBid |$ 8.26
3.1|T-Shirt, safety green 2 XL $ 12.65 $ 1234
3.1|T-Shirt, safety green 3 XL $ 15.05 $ 1435
3.1|T-Shirt, safety green 4 XL $ 15.18 $ 1435
3.1|T-Shirt, safety green 5XL $ 15.18 $ 1435
3.1|T-Shirt, safety green 6 XL No Bid No Bid
3.1|T-Shirt, safety green 8 XL No Bid No Bid

Item Size Acme Barker Charm CHealth |ICS Pacific Pyramid Shoes Victory
3.2|Hooded Sweatshirt, safety gr{SM - XL No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid |[$ 1540 |NoBid |[NoBid |NoBid |$ 11.92
3.2|Hooded Sweatshirt, safety gr|2 XL $ 22.85 $§ 1385
3.2|Hooded Sweatshirt, safety gr|3 XL $ 22.85 $ 13.85
3.2|Hooded Sweatshirt, safety gr|4 XL $ 23.05 $ 13.85
3.2|Hooded Sweatshirt, safety gr|5 XL $ 23.05 $meii3785
3.2|Hooded Sweatshirt, safety gr{6 XL No Bid No Bid
3.2|Hooded Sweatshirt, safety gr{8 XL No Bid No Bid

Ttem Size Acme Barker Charm CHealth |ICS Pacific Pyramid Shoes Victory
4.1|Elastic Waist Inmate Pants, gMD - XL No Bid No Bid $ 6.59 | NoBid $ 13.95 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 6.21
4.1|Elastic Waist Inmate Pants, g2 XL No Bid No Bid $ 6.59 $§ 13.95 $ 621
4.1|Elastic Waist Inmate Pants, g4 XL No Bid No Bid $ 7.18 $ 15.30 $ 6.89
4.1|Elastic Waist Inmate Pants, g6 XL No Bid No Bid $ 7.88 $ 17.00 $ 7.58
4.1|Elastic Waist Inmate Pants, g8 XL No Bid No Bid $§ 854 $ 19.00 $ 8.75
4.1|Elastic Waist Inmate Pants, kSM - XL $ 6.00 | $ 798 1% 6.59 $ 13.95 $ 6.21
4.1|Elastic Waist Inmate Pants, K2 XL $ 6.00 % 7988 6.59 $ 13.95 $ 6.21
4.1|Elastic Waist Inmate Pants, K3 XL $ 650 $ 848 1% 6.90 $ 15.30 $ 6.89
4.1|Elastic Waist Inmate Pants, k4 XL $ 6.50 | $ 848 | § 7.18 $ 15.30 $ 6.89




RFP: 071-24 Clothing Items Tabulation
Closed 01/07/2025
4.1|Elastic Waist Inmate Pants, k5 XL $ 7.00 | $ 9.18($ 7.54 $ 1530 $ 7.58
4.1|Elastic Waist Inmate Pants, k6 XL $ 8.00|$ 9.18($ 7.88 $ 17.00 $ 7.58
Item Size Acme Barker Charm C Health ICS Pacific Pyramid Shoes Victory
4.2|Polo Shirt, forest green SM - XL No Bid $ 6.84 [NoBid |No Bid $§ 888 |NoBid [NoBid |NoBid |$ 6.66
4.2|Polo Shirt, forest green 2 XL $ 8.45 $ 12.05 § 841
4.2|Polo Shirt, forest green 3 XL $ 9.36 $§ 13.78 $ 8.41
4.2|Polo Shirt, forest green 4 XL $ 9.36 $§ 13.78 $ 8.41
4.2|Polo Shirt, forest green 5XL $ 9.36 $ 13.78 $ 8.41
4.2|Polo Shirt, forest green 6 XL No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.2|Polo Shirt, maroon SM - XL No Bid $ 6.84 |No Bid No Bid $ 8.88|NoBid |[NoBid | NoBid $ 6.66
4.2|Polo Shirt, maroon 2 XL $ 8.45 $ 12.05 $ 8.41
4.2|Polo Shirt, maroon 3XL $ 9.36 $ 13.78 3$ 8.41
4.2{Polo Shirt, maroon 4 XL $ 9.36 $ 13.78 $ 8.41
4.2|Polo Shirt, maroon 5XL $ 9.36 $ 13.78 $ 8.41
4.2|Polo Shirt, maroon 6 XL No Bid No Bid No Bid
Item Size Acme Barker Charm C Health ICS Pacific Pyramid Shoes Victory
4.3|T-Shirts, white SM - XL No Bid $ 1.63 |$ 2.26 |No Bid $ 2760|% 2.44 [NoBid |NoBid $ 2.10
4.3| T-Shirts, white 2 XL $ 1.88|$§ 254 $ 3335|% 2.60 $ 2.89
4.3| T-Shirts, white 3 XL $ 208 |$ 2.64 § 4205|838 2.85 $ 2.89
4.3|T-Shirts, white 4 XL $ 22518 274 $ 425818 3.15 $ 3.20
4.3|T-Shirts, white 5XL $ 27118 2.84 $ 4350|$8 3.50 $ 3.20
4.3|T-Shirts, white 6 XL $ 35718 294 $§ 4595|% 3.80 $ 3.62
4.3|T-Shirts, white 8 XL $ 35718 536 $ 53458 445 $ 5.21
Item Size Acme Barker Charm C Health ICS Pacific Pyramid Shoes Victory
4.4|Athletic Shorts, orange SM - XL No Bid $ 52518% 5.90 |NoBid $ 3.68 |NoBid [NoBid [NoBid $ 5.44
4.4|Athletic Shorts, orange 2 XL $ 5508 7.54 $ 3.68 $ 5.44
4.4|Athletic Shorts, orange 3XL No Bid § 772 $ 4.18 $ 5.44
4.4|Athletic Shorts, orange 4 XL $ 6.50 [$§ 7.90 § 448 $ 5.44




RFP: 071-24 Clothing Items Tabulation
Closed 01/07/2025
4.4]Athletic Shorts, orange 5XL No Bid § 8.54 § 5.05 No Bid
4.4]Athletic Shorts, orange 6 XL $ 6.80|% 890 § 548 No Bid
Item Size Acme Barker Charm CHealth |ICS Pacific Pyramid Shoes Victory
4.5|Work Jeans 29x30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 27.50 [ NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid
4.5|Work Jeans 30x30 No Bid $ 27.50
4.5|Work Jeans 30x32 $ 9.88 $ 27.50
4.5|Work Jeans 30x34 $ 9.88 | § 27.50
4.5|Work Jeans 32x30 No Bid '$ 27.50
4.5|Work Jeans 32x32 $ 9.88 $§ 27.50
4.5|Work Jeans 32x34 $ 9.88 $ 27.50
4.5|Work Jeans 34x34 $ 9.88 $ 27.50
4.5|Work Jeans 34x36 No Bid $ 27.50
4.5|Work Jeans 36x32 $ 9.88 $ 27.50
4.5|Work Jeans 36x34 $ 9.88 $ 27.50
4.5(Work Jeans 36x36 No Bid $ 27.50
4.5|Work Jeans 38x32 $ 9.88 $ 27.50
4.5|Work Jeans 38x34 $ 9.88 $ 27.50
4.5|Work Jeans 38x36 No Bid $ 27.50
4.5|Work Jeans 40x32 $ 9.88 $ 27.50
4.5|Work Jeans 40x32 $ 9.88 $ 27.50
4.5|Work Jeans 40x34 $ 9.88 $ 27.50
4.5|Work Jeans 40x36 No Bid $ 27.50
4.5|Work Jeans 42x32 $ 9.88 $ 27.50
4.5|Work Jeans 42x34 $ 9.88 $ 27.50
4.5|Work Jeans 42x36 No Bid $§ 27.50
4.5(Work Jeans 44x32 $ 9.88 $ 27.50
4.5|Work Jeans 44x34 $ 9.88 $§ 27.50
4.5(Work Jeans 44x36 No Bid $ 27.50
4.5|Work Jeans 46x32 $ 9.88 $§ 27.50
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