County of Orange

Department of General Services

Goshen, New York 10924

www.orangecountygov.com

(845) 291-2792

Sheriff and Corrections Uniforms and Equipment (RCO-0C002-25)
Letting of Tuesday, February 4, 2025, @ 3:00 pm

GALLS HERKIMER INDUSTRIES UNITED UNIFORM DISTRIBUTION
e DEscRIPTION pricEEACH | MANUPACTURER/ | ooy, | manrRcTURER/ [
OUTERWEAR
1 |Blauer Reversible Rain Jacket $125.07 NO BID NO BID Blauer 26991 $129.50
2 |5.11Tactical 3 in 1 Parka $191.32 NO BID NO BID 5.11 48001 $209.50
3 [5.11 valiant Duty Jacket - Command Staff $242.91 NO BID NO BID 5.11 48153 $269.50
4 |Flying Cross LayerTech Soft-Shell Jacket $87.89 NO BID NO BID Flying Cross 54100A $112.50
5 |5.11 Sabre Jacket 2.0 $211.00 NO BID NO BID 5.1148112 $210.50
6 |Rothco Soft Shell Jacket $100.61 NO BID NO BID Rothco 9767 $110.50
7 |Cobmex Zipper Front Crew Cardigan Sweater $64.18 NO BID NO BID Cobmex 4022 $59.50
8 |Rothco Quarter-Zip Acrylic Commando Sweater $36.55 NO BID NO BID Rothco 3390 $44.50
9 [5.11% Zip Job Shirt $77.55 NO BID NO BID 5.1172314 $77.50
10 [First Tactical Women'’s Cotton Job Shirt Quarter Zip $71.00 NO BID NO BID First Tactical 128507 $77.50
11 |Blauer Zip-Front Breakaway Safety Vest $67.96 NO BID NO BID Blauer 343S $67.50
12 [ULINE Hi-Vis Safety Sash Belt- Lime $13.17 NO BID NO BID Uline S-23369G $15.00
13 [Baseball Cap FlexFit 110M $13.75 NO BID NO BID FlexFit 110M $13.75
14 |K-9 Shoulder Patch: $0.00 NO BID NO BID Custom $4.00
15 [Sheriff K-9 Unit Patch: $0.00 NO BID NO BID Custom $4.00
16 |ID Patch: $4.00 NO BID NO BID Custom $4.00
ACADEMY AND PT WEAR
17 [Trousers, Probationary Deputies $26.41 NO BID NO BID Dickies 8745V $35.00
18 |Long Sleeve Shirt, Probationary Deputies $40.61 NO BID NO BID Dickies 574SV $39.50
19 |Short Sleeve Shirt, Probationary Deputies $13.76 NO BID NO BID Dickies 1574SV $36.50
20 |Sweatpant, Jerzees $19.99 NO BID NO BID Jerzees 973M $20.00
21 |Sweatshirt, Jerzees $30.99 NO BID NO BID Jerzees 562M $17.50
22 |T-Shirt, Jerzees $20.99 NO BID NO BID Jerzees 29M $15.00
23 |Jersey Shorts, Augusta $23.10 NO BID NO BID Augusta 915 $22.50
24 |Damascus Frisker k Leather Glove $4.93 NO BID NO BID Damascus DFK300 $26.50
25 |Black Knit Hat, Rothco $55.25 NO BID NO BID Rothco 5464 $9.50
26 |5.11 Patrol Ready Bag $26.27 NO BID NO BID 5.11 59012 $60.00
27 |Dickies Women’s Work Pants $19.63 NO BID NO BID Dickies FP774 $29.50
28 |Dickies Women'’s Long Sleeve Work Shirt $22.82 NO BID NO BID Dickies FL5350 $30.50
29 |Dickies Women'’s Short Sleeve Work Shirt $22.96 NO BID NO BID Dickies FS574 $30.50
BIKE & BOAT PATROL
30 |Performance Polo $50.35 NO BID NO BID 5.11 71049/71049T $59.50
31 |Bike Shorts, Tact Squad $50.14 NO BID NO BID Tac Squad B7188BK $55.00
32 |Bike Pants, Tact Squad $83.94 NO BID NO BID Tac Squad B708BK $75.00
33 |Bike Gloves, Hatch $9.90 NO BID NO BID Damascus D22S $12.00
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34 |Bike Jacket, Tact Squad NO BID NO BID NO BID Tac Squad B117YB $175.00
35 [Salomon XA Pro 3D GTX Forces Shoe $140.00 NO BID NO BID Salomon 140921600 $140.00
36 |HAIX Black Eagle Athletic 2.1 T Low $151.27 HAIX #: 330016 $139.91 Haix 330016 $175.00

SHERIFF UNIFORMS/CORRECTION UNIFORMS
37 |Men's Trouser Fechheimer Women's Fechheimer NO BID NO BID NO BID Fiving Cross S38768/5381  $145.00
38 |Blauer Class A Long Sleeve Shirts $106.40 NO BID NO BID Blauer 8450/8450W $106.50
39 |Blauer Class A Short Sleeve Shirts $101.80 NO BID NO BID Blauer 8460/8460W $100.50
40 |Emblems, 5” OC Sheriff’s Office $0.00 NO BID NO BID Custom $4.00
41 [Emblems, 3” OC Sheriff’s Office $5.07 NO BID NO BID Custom $4.00
42 |Standard American Flag Patch Rothco $0.61 NO BID NO BID Custom $1.75
43 |Sergeant Chevron $0.00 NO BID NO BID Custom $1.50
44 (5.11 Class B Women's Stryke Short Sleeve Shirt $94.18 NO BID NO BID 5.11 61018 $90.50
45 |5.11 Class B Women'’s Stryke Long Sleeve Shirt $99.18 NO BID NO BID 5.11 62010 $94.50
46 [5.11 Men’s Stryke Long Sleeve Shirt $99.18 NO BID NO BID 5.11 72074 $94.50
47 |5.11 Men'’s Stryke Short Sleeve Shirt $75.22 NO BID NO BID 5.1171038 $90.50
48 |ID Patch $4.00 NO BID NO BID Custom $4.00
49 |Sergeant Chevron patch $0.00 NO BID NO BID Custom $1.50
50 |American Flag patch, Velcro backing $1.00 NO BID NO BID Rothco 1666 $1.75
51 |Rank insignia tabs for collar placement

a) Sheriff - four stars $1.99 NO BID NO BID Custom $2.50
b) Undersheriff - three stars $1.99 NO BID NO BID Custom $2.50
c) Chief - two stars $1.99 NO BID NO BID Custom $2.50
d) Major - oak leaves $1.99 NO BID NO BID Custom $2.50
e) Captain - dual bars $1.99 NO BID NO BID Custom $2.50
f) Lieutenant - single bar $1.99 NO BID NO BID Custom $2.50
g) Sergeant - chevrons $1.99 NO BID NO BID Custom $2.50
h) First sergeant - chevrons $1.99 NO BID NO BID Custom $2.50
52 |5.11 Class B Stryke Women's Pant $63.51 NO BID NO BID 5.11 64402 $75.00
53 |[5.11 Class B Stryke Men’s Pant $64.59 NO BID NO BID 5.11 74427 $75.00
54 |Department Patch, 4”x5” $5.68 NO BID NO BID Custom $4.00
55 |Deputy Badge Patch 3”X3” NO BID NO BID NO BID Custom $4.00
56 |ID Patch with Velcro NO BID NO BID NO BID Custom $4.00
57 |Collar Rank Insignia. Metal, Smooth Gold Finish
a) Sheriff-four stars $15.06 NO BID NO BID Custom $14.50
b) Undersheriff-three stars $15.06 NO BID NO BID Custom $13.50
c) Colonel-eagles $15.06 NO BID NO BID Custom $10.50
d) Chief-two stars $15.06 NO BID NO BID Custom $7.50
e) Major-oak leaves $15.06 NO BID NO BID Custom $7.50
f) Captain-dual bars $15.06 NO BID NO BID Custom $7.50
g) Lieutenant-single bar $15.06 NO BID NO BID Custom $7.50
h) Sergeant-chevrons $15.06 NO BID NO BID Custom $7.50




GALLS HERKIMER INDUSTRIES UNITED UNIFORM DISTRIBUTION
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i) First Sgt. Collar insignia $15.06 NO BID NO BID Custom $7.50
58 |5.11 Tactical Polo $50.61 NO BID NO BID 5.1171182 $58.50
59 [Patch: Field Training Officer $0.00 NO BID NO BID Custom $4.00
60 |Patch: First Sgt. Sleeve Chevron $0.00 NO BID NO BID Custom $4.00
61 |Vest Patch: K-9 $11.83 NO BID NO BID Custom $6.50
62 |Vest Patch: Patrol/Correction $11.83 NO BID NO BID Custom $6.50
63 |Hat, Stratton F-38 $110.00 NO BID NO BID Stratton F-38 $125.00
64 |Propper I.C.E. Performance Long Sleeve Women'’s Polo $47.71 NO BID NO BID Propper F5357 $58.50
65 |Propper I.C.E. Performance Women'’s Short Sleeve $43.12 NO BID NO BID Propper F5327 $54.50
66 |Men’s Propper I.C.E Performance Short Sleeve Polo $45.00 NO BID NO BID Propper F5341 $54.50
67 |Men’s Propper |.C.E. Performance Long Sleeve Polo $44.49 NO BID NO BID Propper F5315 $58.50
68 |FX Flex (FX S.T.A.T) Men’s Long Sleeve Hybrid $45.00 NO BID NO BID Flying Cross FX7020VS $48.50
69 |FXFlex (FX S.T.A.T) Men’s Short Sleeve Hybrid Shirt $45.00 NO BID NO BID Flying Cross FX7000VS $44.50
70 |FX Flex (FX S.T.A.T) Women’s Long Sleeve Hybrid Shirt $48.00 NO BID NO BID FF)'(V;B;C\;‘S’;; $48.50
71 |FX Flex (FX S.T.A.T) Women’s Short Sleeve Hybrid Shirt $45.00 NO BID NO BID Flying Cross $44.50
FX7000VSW
72 |ID Patch $4.00 NO BID NO BID Custom $4.00
73 |[Sergeant Chevron Patch $0.00 NO BID NO BID Custom $1.50
74 |American Flag patch, Rothco 1666 $1.00 NO BID NO BID Rothco 1666 $1.75
75 |Blauer FLEXRS™ Covert Tactical Pant $96.59 NO BID NO BID Blauer 8666/8666W $90.00
76 |Blauer FLEXRS™ Long Sleeve Supershirt $102.57 NO BID NO BID Blauer 8671/8671W $90.00
77 |Blauer FLEXRS™ Short Sleeve Supershirt $99.58 NO BID NO BID Blauer 8676/8676W $85.00
78 |Blauer, Flexheat Winter Base Shirt $116.98 NO BID NO BID Blauer 8374/8374W $95.00
CORRECTIONS UNIFORMS
79 [Men’s Vertex Coldblack Short Polo $46.97 NO BID NO BID Vertx VTX4000 $47.50
80 |Women'’s Vertex Coldblack Short Sleeve Polo $46.97 NO BID NO BID Vertx VTX4010 $47.50
81 |Men’s Vertex Coldblack Long Sleeve Polo $50.34 NO BID NO BID Vertx VTX 4020P $51.50
82 |Vertex Women'’s Coldblack Long Sleeve Polo $45.34 NO BID NO BID Vertx VTX 4030P $51.50
83 |Tru-Spec Women'’s Original Tactical Pants $41.97 NO BID NO BID Tru-Spec 1095 $46.50
84 |Class B Long Sleeve Shirt 5.11 Polo $40.00 NO BID NO BID 5.11 42056 $44.50
85 |Cotton Tactical Pant 5.11 Tactical Pant $41.42 NO BID NO BID 5.11 74273 $46.50
86 |Orange County Sheriff’s Office Patch $0.00 NO BID NO BID Custom $4.00
87 |ID Patch $4.00 NO BID NO BID Custom $4.00
88 [Sergeant Chevron Patch $0.00 NO BID NO BID Custom $1.50
89 |American Flag Patch $0.61 NO BID NO BID Custom $1.75
SHOES AND BOOTS
90 [Thorogood Boot $139.44 NO BID NO BID Lg%;‘}i‘;j‘fﬁizt $145.00
91 |[Danner Recon $333.63 NO BID NO BID Danner 69410 $347.00
92 |Danner Patrol 6” GTX $317.75 NO BID NO BID Danner 25200 $330.00
93 [Danner Men’s 8” Tanicus $142.99 NO BID NO BID Danner 55317 $148.50
94 |Wolverine Men’s 6” boots $84.51 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
95 |5.11 ATAC 2.0 6” Side Zip Boot $74.13 NO BID NO BID 5.11 12405 $85.00
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96 |5.11 ATAC 2.0. 8” Side Zip Boot $81.76 NO BID NO BID 5.11 12391 $95.00
97 |5.11 ATAC 8” Storm Boot 1 Women’s/Men’s $101.38 NO BID NO BID 5.11 12406/12392 $115.00
98 |Reebok Women's 8” Zip Composite Toe Boot $109.15 NO BID NO BID Reebok RB806 $120.00
99 |Reebok Work Postal Express — Chukka Boot $135.92 NO BID NO BID Reebok $150.00
CP8500/CP850
100 |Reebok Work Postal Express - Oxford $114.79 NO BID NO BID cpgig?/ggsgm $140.00
101 |HAIX Enforce X High 7" Boot $300.00 HAIX #: 206275 $226.25 Haix 206275 $285.00
102 |HAIX Enforce X MID 5” Boot $252.68 HAIX #: 206276 $212.71 Haix 206276 $275.00
103 |HAIX Black Eagle Tactical 8” 2.0 GTX High Side Zip $210.42 HAIX #: 340021 $189.31 Haix 340021 $225.00
104 |Bates Women's Black Leather High Gloss Oxford $55.72 NO BID NO BID Bates E22741 $65.50
105 |Bates Black Leather High Gloss Oxford $55.72 NO BID NO BID Bates E1840 $82.50
K-9 UNIFORMS
106 |Watch Cap $19.10 NO BID NO BID 5.11 89250 $19.00
107 |K-9 Shoulder Patch $0.00 NO BID NO BID Custom $4.00
108 |Sheriff K-9 Unit Patch $5.07 NO BID NO BID Custom $4.00
109 |ID Patch $4.00 NO BID NO BID Custom $4.00
110 [Salomon XA Pro 3D Mid Forces $170.42 NO BID NO BID Salomon FT1115 $182.00
111 [Merrell Men’s Moab 2 Mid Tactical Waterproof Boot $101.41 NO BID NO BID FW1037 $130.00
112 [HAIX Black Eagle Tactical 6” 2.0 GTX Mid Side Zip Unisex $195.24 HAIX #: 340043 $183.07 Haix 340043 $225.00
SOG UNIFORMS
113 |SOG Eagle Embroidery $1.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
114 |Born Primitive Ridgeline Beanie NO BID NO BID NO BID Bo;r:dF;reilrir::ve $60.00
115 |Born Primitive Long Sleeve OP TOP $80.00 NO BID NO BID Born Pr":(i)t;ve BOPL 160,00
116 |Born Primitive Short Sleeve OP TOP $70.00 NO BID NO BID Born Pr":g;"e SOPT s13300
117 |Born Primitive Assault Pants NO BID NO BID NO BID Born Primitive $275.00
Assault Pants
118 |Crye Precision G3 Combat Shirt or app $213.94 NO BID NO BID Cry::;z;’;'on $230.00
119 |Crye Precision G3 Combat Pant or approved equal $337.75 NO BID NO BID Cryi:;i;i:ion $360.00
120 |Crye Precision G3 Field Shirt or approved equal $221.41 NO BID NO BID Cryi:;gi:ion $238.00
121 |Crye Precision Modular Rigger Belt or approved equal $166.06 NO BID NO BID Cry’i}/lz:lr;i;ion $175.00
122 |5.11 Short sleeve Performance Polo with embroidery $61.94 NO BID NO BID 5.11 71049 $62.50
123 |5.11 Long sleeve Performance Polo with embroidery $100.13 NO BID NO BID 5.11 72049 $58.50
124 |Tru-Spec Men’s 24-7 Original Tactical Pants $41.97 NO BID NO BID Tru-Spec 1062 $48.00
125 |Tru-Spec Women'’s 24-7 Original Tactical Pants $41.97 NO BID NO BID Tru-Spec 1095 $48.00
126 |5.11 Women'’s Short Sleeve Performance Polo $60.30 NO BID NO BID 5.11 61165 $62.50
127 |5.11 Women'’s Long Sleeve Performance Polo $64.67 NO BID NO BID 5.11 62408 $58.50
128 |Crye Precision AirFlex Knee Pads or approved equal $39.86 NO BID NO BID CrysAP[;icCi;ion $42.50
129 |Kuhl Revolvr Pant $76.76 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
130 |Crye Precision AirFlex Elbow Pads or approved equal $40.56 NO BID NO BID EZ;;T:{I]SAEZ $43.50
131 |Salomon XA Forces Mid GTX Shoe or approved equal $170.42 NO BID NO BID Salomon L40921800 $182.00
132 |Salomon Quest 4D 2 GTX or approved equal $201.41 NO BID NO BID Salomon $230.00
133 [Men’s Hoka Kaha Gore-Tex Boot NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
134 |ID Patch $0.00 NO BID NO BID Custom $4.00
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135 |First Spear American Flag IR Cell Tag NO BID NO BID NO BID First Spear $45.00

136 |[First Spear Alpha Numeric IR-Glo Cell Tag NO BID NO BID NO BID First Spear $45.00

137 |Lowa Zephyr GTX Mid TF Boot $180.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MISCELLANEOUS EQUIPMENT

138 |Black Leather Canine Handler Gloves, 5.11 NO BID NO BID NO BID 5.11 59360 $27.50

139 [Don Hume Gun Belt $62.39 NO BID NO BID Boston Leather 6501 $70.00

140 |Chemical Spray Holder, Desantis U40 $19.00 NO BID NO BID DeSantis U40 $43.50

141 |Handcuffs, Smith & Wesson Model 100P $29.58 NO BID NO BID Smithi‘)(\)’xesm $33.50

142 |Boot Cuff Oversized Leg Irons, Chicago Model 2500 $76.06 NO BID NO BID Chicago Model 2500 $76.50

143 |Oversized Nickel Finish Handcuffs, Chicago Model 1400 NO BID NO BID NO BID Chicago Model 1400 $44.50

144 |Smith & Warren C511 name Plate $25.00 NO BID NO BID Smithi:’ra"e" $28.50

145 |Smith & Warren Tie Bar/Tie Tac NO BID NO BID NO BID Smithcgs‘(\;za"e" $28.50

146 |CAT GEN 7 Tourniquet $27.69 AT T Cose o110 $22.59 Ez:: American $33.50

147 |Don Hume Garrison Belt $27.58 NO BID NO BID Gould if;"dmh $45.00

148 |North American Rescue Tourniquet Holder $19.66 NO BID NO BID 2:2::?2}?3;2: $35.50

149 |VTAC Cobra Belt $101.39 NO BID NO BID VTAC 52873 $105.00
PERCENT DISCOUNT

s e 0o v et

BASIS OF AWARD COST
Points | 60 so | a0 | 30 [ 20 ] 10
Price | low price | 2" lowest | 3" lowest | 4™ lowest | 5" lowest | 6™ lowest

This request for competitive offer (RCO) is a formal bid with a best value basis of
award, which means that the lowest price may not be the determining factor in the
award. Awards may be made to the highest scoring offeror.

Criteria Points
Cost 10-60
Ability to provide on-site stock +10
Delivery within 30 days +20
Delivery within 31-45 days +10
Delivery within 46-60 days +5
References 2-10
Total 115

Any award shall be subject to the issuance of a purchase order or the
execution of a contract between the bidder and the County of Orange.

Denotes Award

Foonce Hrnali O Rogan

Renee Arnold-O'Regan

Commissioner of General Services
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