County of Orange

Department of General Services
Goshen, New York 10924
Wwww.orangecountygov.com

Inmate Coveralls and Two-Piece Garments (RFB-OC171-22)
Letting of Tuesday, December 20, 2022 @ 3:30 PM

CCLIIEE'::L'LS ANGIELYNS BOB BARKER CHARM-TEX
SIZE RED BLUE | YELLOW | RED BLUE | YELLOW | RED BLUE | YELLOW
SMALL $10.75 $10.75 $10.75 $17.00 $17.00 $17.00 $18.90 $18.90 $18.90
MEDIUM $10.75 $10.75 $10.75 $17.00 $17.00 $17.00 $18.90 $18.90 $18.90
LARGE $10.75 $10.75 $10.75 $17.00 $17.00 $17.00 $18.90 $18.90 $18.90
X-LARGE $10.75 $10.75 $10.75 $17.00 $17.00 $17.00 $18.90 $18.90 $18.90
2X-LARGE $11.50 $11.50 $11.50 $17.00 $17.00 $17.00 $18.90 $18.90 $18.90
3X-LARGE $11.50 $11.50 $11.50 $17.00 $17.00 $17.00 $19.90 $19.90 $19.90
4X-LARGE $11.50 $11.50 $11.50 $17.00 $17.00 $17.00 $20.90 $20.90 $20.90
5X-LARGE $11.50 $11.50 $11.50 $17.00 $17.00 $17.00 $21.90 $21.90 $21.90
6X-LARGE $11.95 $11.95 $11.95 $17.00 $17.00 $17.00 $22.90 $22.90 $22.90
7X-LARGE $11.95 $11.95 $11.95 $17.00 $17.00 $17.00 $23.90 $23.90 $23.90
8X-LARGE $11.95 $11.95 $11.95 $17.00 $17.00 $17.00 $24.90 $24.90 $24.90
SIZE GREEN | WHITE | ORANGE | GREEN | WHITE | ORANGE | GREEN | WHITE | ORANGE
SMALL $10.75 $10.75 $10.75 $17.00 $17.00 $17.00 $18.90 $18.90 $18.90
MEDIUM $10.75 $10.75 $10.75 $17.00 $17.00 $17.00 $18.90 $18.90 $18.90
LARGE $10.75 $10.75 $10.75 $17.00 $17.00 $17.00 $18.90 $18.90 $18.90
X-LARGE $10.75 $10.75 $10.75 $17.00 $17.00 $17.00 $18.90 $18.90 $18.90
2X-LARGE $11.50 $11.50 $11.50 $17.00 $17.00 $17.00 $18.90 $18.90 $18.90
3X-LARGE $11.50 $11.50 $11.50 $17.00 $17.00 $17.00 $19.90 $19.90 $19.90
4X-LARGE $11.50 $11.50 $11.50 $17.00 $17.00 $17.00 $20.90 $20.90 $20.90
5X-LARGE $11.50 $11.50 $11.50 $17.00 $17.00 $17.00 $21.90 $21.90 $21.90
6X-LARGE $11.95 $11.95 $11.95 $17.00 $17.00 $17.00 $22.90 $22.90 $22.90
7X-LARGE $11.95 $11.95 $11.95 $17.00 $17.00 $17.00 $23.90 $23.90 $23.90
8X-LARGE $11.95 $11.95 $11.95 $17.00 $17.00 $17.00 $24.90 $24.90 $24.90
PI'ETCEE"’('SZA‘RT“‘,’I‘;?\"TS ANGIELYNS BOB BARKER CHARM-TEX
SIZE RED BLUE | YELLOwW | RED BLUE | YELLOW | RED BLUE | YELLOW
10X-LARGE $13.50 $13.50 $13.50 $23.75 $23.75 $23.75 $24.90 $24.90 $24.90
11X-LARGE $13.50 $13.50 $13.50 $25.50 $25.50 $25.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
12X-LARGE $13.50 $13.50 $13.50 $25.50 $25.50 $25.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
13X-LARGE $13.50 $13.50 $13.50 $29.25 $29.25 $29.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
14X-LARGE $13.50 $13.50 $13.50 $29.25 $29.25 $29.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SIZE GREEN | WHITE | ORANGE | GREEN | WHITE | ORANGE | GREEN | WHITE | ORANGE
10X-LARGE $13.50 $13.50 $13.50 $23.75 $23.75 $23.75 $24.90 $24.90 $24.90
11X-LARGE $13.50 $13.50 $13.50 $25.50 $25.50 $25.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
12X-LARGE $13.50 $13.50 $13.50 $25.50 $25.50 $25.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
13X-LARGE $13.50 $13.50 $13.50 $29.25 $29.25 $29.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
14X-LARGE $13.50 $13.50 $13.50 $29.25 $29.25 $29.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Bob Barker Notes:

- Coveralls have 6 solid brass, nickel plated buttons
- Two-Piece Garments are sold 6 per case

- Two-Piece Garments are not sold as a set

- Spec sheets attached

Any award shall be subject to the issuance of a purchase order or the
execution of a contract between the bidder and the County of Orange.

Denotes Award

Samantha Sweikata
Acting Commissioner



