
Fire Training Center Uniform (RCO-OC044-24)

Letting of Wednesday, April 17, 2024, @ 3:00 pm

Item

#
Details Galls

Harriman Army 

Navy

Emergency 

Responder

1 Smith and Warren Badge $63.53 $89.60 $89.60
2 Smith and Warren Badge $63.53 $105.60 $105.60

3 Ridge Oxford Dress Shoe $68.49 $54.99 $52.35
4 Leather Garrison Belt $23.67 $24.00 $24.99
5 Elbelco Double Breasted Blouse $224.76 $299.95 $314.99

6 Elbelco Luxury Wool Trousers $86.23 $108.00 $111.75
7 Paragon Plus Long Sleeve Shirt $33.35 $36.95 $54.95

8 Paragon Plus Short Sleeve Shirt $28.67 $34.95 $46.99
9 Smith Warren Name Plate $9.77 $13.60 $13.60

10 Smith Warren Tie Clip $35.00 $34.00 $33.99

11 Bell Hat $54.79 $90.75 $74.99
12 Uniform Ties $3.63 $6.95 $6.99

13 Uniform Gloves $2.74 $4.60 $4.60
14 Gold Collar Brass - Open Bugles $21.48 $10.95 $9.95

15 Gold Collar Brass - Closed Bugles $21.48 $10.95 $10.50
16 Gold Hat Badge $21.48 $26.80 $26.80

17 American Flag patches $0.47 $1.25 $2.00
18 Flying Cross long sleeve button $50.86 $54.99 $51.25
19 Flying Cross short sleeve button $48.40 $49.99 $43.82

20 Elbeco TexTrop Long Sleeve Shirt $44.32 $64.95 $59.99
21 Elbeco TexTrop Short Sleeve Shirt $41.15 $58.20 $55.96

22 Thorogood  6"" Commando Deuce $95.89 $129.60 $109.50
23 Rothco Forced Entry Security $38.79 $47.99 $47.99
24 Rothco Tactical Utility Oxford Shoe $50.00 $43.99 $43.99
25 Winter Boots-North Face $217.81 No Bid No Bid

26 8 in Work Boots $112.33 $162.00 $158.60
27 Insulated Coveralls $64.32 $79.99 $79.99
28 Carhartt Duck Bib Overall Lined $89.04 No Bid $113.50
29 5.11 Tactical Watchcap $11.66 $16.00 $19.99
30 5.11 Series or equivalent Twill Ball $13.11 $5.99 $16.99

31 Boonie Hats W/OC TECH RESCUE $20.09 $12.95 $23.75
32 Winter Hats W/ OC TECH RESCUE $11.30 $6.95 $13.99

33 5.11 Tactical Series or equivalent $32.34 $39.99 $41.49
34 Winter Gloves-North Face $40.00 No Bid No Bid
35 Ringers Gloves for Rope Rescue $19.07 $23.99 $19.69

GROUP 2- OUTER WEAR

GROUP 1
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Item

#
Details Galls

Harriman Army 

Navy

Emergency 

Responder

36 Oversized Turnout Gear Bag $64.10 $54.99 $75.59
37 Baseball Hat 47 brand-Relaxed fit- $6.89 $7.95 $16.99
38 Baseball Hat 47 brand-Relaxed fit- $6.89 $7.95 $16.99

39 3-in-1 Reversible High-Vis Parka $201.82 No Bid $263.34
40 Game Navigator Jacket $128.69 $76.80 $96.96
41 Anchor Uniforms "Darien" Classic $276.81 $255.00 $269.00
42 5.11 Sabre Jacket $186.08 $229.50 $263.34

43 5.11 Valiant Jacket $215.23 $263.50 $290.67
44 ANSI Type 3 Safety Vest with $22.77 $19.99 $29.99
45 Blauer CROSSTECH® 3-IN-1 $388.92 $367.84 $490.00
46 Carhartt Blanket Lined Black Duck $164.38 No Bid $129.00

47 Carhartt Blanket Lined Black Duck $164.38 No Bid $99.00
48 5.11 Tactical 3 in 1 Black Parka $286.30 $229.50 $273.00

49 Winter Gear Coat-North Face $80.00 No Bid No Bid
50 Quilted Nylon Jacket $100.00 $57.60 $107.88

51 Elbeco Regulations Turtleneck $40.00 $29.99 $32.50
52 5.11 Tactical Short sleeve polo $34.73 $42.50 $72.48

53 5.11 Tactical Short Sleeve Shirt $41.88 $51.00 $81.65
54 5.11 Tactical Long Sleeve Shirt $55.00 $55.25 $85.04

55 5.11 1/4 Zip Job Shirt $48.90 $59.50 $90.47
56 5.11 Job Shirt with Denim Details $95.89 $59.50 $90.47

57 5.11 Job Shirt with Denim Details $95.89 $59.50 $90.47
58 5.11 Job Shirt with Denim Details $95.89 $59.50 $90.47

59 5.11 Long Sleeve Tactical Uniform $59.95 $54.40 $87.04
60 5.11 Men's L/S Station Shirt A Class $75.34 $59.50 $73.89
61 5.11 Men's S/S Station Shirt A Class $68.49 $55.25 $69.48

62 5.11 Men's L/S Station Shirt A Class $75.34 $59.50 $73.89
63 5.11 Men's S/S Station Shirt A Class $68.49 $55.25 $69.48
64 5.11 Men's professional polo shirt $36.85 $42.50 $72.48

65 5.11 Men's professional polo shirt $36.85 $42.50 $72.48
66 5.11 Tactical Series or equivalent $38.16 $59.50 $34.98

67 Hanes Comfort Short Sleeve Shirt $16.37 $13.50 $24.99
68 5.11 Men's Pro Long Sleeve Polo $46.38 $46.75 $88.89
69 5.11 Performance Short sleeve $33.40 $40.80 $82.78
70 Dress Shirt S/S: Blauer Street Gear $68.46 No Bid $46.25
71 Dress Shirt S/S: Blauer Street Gear $73.92 No Bid $74.82

72 Carhartt Rockland Sherpa-Lined $102.74 $63.75 $78.00
73 Carhartt Midweight Hooded Zip $40.41 $46.75 $102.20
74 Carhartt relaxed fit short sleeve t- $17.12 No Bid $50.90

75 Winter  Gear Pants-North Face $85.00 No Bid No Bid

76 5.11 Taclite Pro 11" Shorts $38.04 $44.20 $56.25

GROUP 4- SHIRTS/HOODIES

GROUP 5- PANTS/SHORTS

GROUP 3-JACKETS/VESTS

  



Item

#
Details Galls

Harriman Army 

Navy

Emergency 

Responder

77 5.11 Taclite Pro 11" Shorts $36.05 $44.20 $46.25
78 5.11 Men's PDU Class B Twill Cargo $48.77 $59.50 $62.47
79 5.11 Tactical Series or equivalent $57.26 $51.00 $53.65

80 Carhartt Canvas Work Short $47.95 $29.99 $31.49
81 Carhartt Rugged Flex Rigby Short $54.78 $33.99 $46.55
82 5.11 Taclite Pro Pant $40.29 $49.30 $51.60

83 Patch $4.00 $3.50 $18.00

84 Embroidery - per letter/per size $8.00 $7.00 $4.00

85
Embroidery- add velcro backing to 

patch
$8.00 $4.50 $6.00

86 5.11 Performance Short Sleeve $48.78 $40.80 $25.00

87 Flying Cross Vertx Coldblack Short $60.76 $46.99 $72.95
88 5.11 Stryke Pant (Men's) $57.76 $69.70 $73.25
89 5.11 Stryke Pant (Women's) $57.26 $69.70 $73.25

90 5.11 Taclite Pro 11” Ripstop Short $36.05 $44.20 $46.25
91 5.11 1/4 Zip Job Shirt $64.28 $59.50 $87.47

92 5.11 A.T.A.C. 2.0 Side Zip Boot $74.41 $103.50 $95.06
93 5.11 A.T.A.C. 2.0 Side Zip Boot $74.41 $103.50 $95.06
94 Under Armour Valsetz RTS 1.5 $95.04 No Bid $126.49

95 Bates 5" Tactical Sport Boot $82.88 No Bid $107.25

96 Bates Women's 5" Tactical Sport $82.88 No Bid $107.25
97 5.11 ATAC 2.0 Side Zip Boot $74.41 $103.50 $95.06
98 5.11 ATAC 2.0 6" Desert $72.10 $99.00 $92.35

99 5.11 1.75" Operator Belt $32.34 $40.80 $26.95
100 5.11 1.5" Trainer Belt $32.34 $40.80 $41.43

101 5.11 Response Jacket $71.05 $78.20 $86.30
102 Embroidery for two front flip out $55.67 $78.20 $12.00
103 Loose Fit Midweight Quarter-Zip $53.05 $49.49 $79.10
104 Men's UA Stellar G2 6" Tactical $59.00 $90.00 $78.50

105 Carhartt Force 5-inch Non-safety $99.32 $125.99 $117.95
106 Men's UA Micro G Valsetz Mid $81.37 $135.00 $107.94
107 5.11 A.T.A.C. 2.08" ARID Boot $79.73 $108.00 $101.85

108 5.11 Performance Long Sleeve Polo $51.43 $44.20 $71.17
109 5.11 Mock Neck Long Sleeve Top $34.68 $42.50 $44.48

110 5.11 Performance Short Sleeve $48.78 $40.80 $54.99
110 Flying Cross Vertx Coldblack Short $56.20 $46.99 $59.95
111 5.11 Stryke Pant (Men's) $57.26 $69.70 $73.33

112 5.11 Stryke Pant (Women's) $57.26 $69.70 $73.33
113 5.11 Women's Taclite Pro Ripstop $40.29 $49.30 $51.60
114 5.11 Men's Taclite Pro Ripstop Pant $40.29 $49.30 $51.60
115 5.11 Taclite Pro 11" Ripstop Short $36.05 $44.20 $46.17

116 5.11 1/4 Zip Job Shirt $65.38 $59.50 $74.47

GROUP 8-911 DISPATCHER UNIFORMS

GROUP 6-EMBROIDERY/PATCHES/TAPE

  

GROUP 7-911 SUPERVISOR UNIFORMS



Item

#
Details Galls

Harriman Army 

Navy

Emergency 

Responder

117 5.11 A.T.A.C. 2.0 Side Zip Boot $74.41 $103.50 $95.06
118 5.11 A.T.A.C. 2.0 Side Zip Boot $74.41 $103.50 $95.06
119 Under Armour Valsetz RTS 1.5 $95.04 No Bid $114.80

120 Bates 5" Tactical Sport Boot $82.88 No Bid $107.25
121 Bates Women's 5" Tactical Sport $82.88 No Bid $107.25
122 5.11 1.5" Trainer Belt $32.34 $40.80 $41.43
123 5.11 1.75" Operator Belt $32.34 $40.80 $41.43

124 5.11 Response Jacket $71.05 $78.20 $83.80
125 Embroidery for two front flip out $55.67 $20.00 $12.00
126 JERZEES Heavyweight Blend T-shirt $4.38 $5.19 $9.50
127 Loose Fit Midweight Quarter-Zip $53.05 $44.99 $63.10
128 Under Armour Micro G Valsetz Side- $81.37 $130.00 $128.45

129 Under Armour Women's Micro G $81.37 No Bid $128.45

130 Storm Defender Loose Fit $103.42 $125.99 $281.85
131 Carhartt Watch Cap 2.0 $15.00 No Bid $32.70

132 Knit Beanie $27.38 $17.99 $21.00
133 Flexfit Yupoong Athletic Brushed $10.14 $9.95 $19.19
134 5.11 Tropos Long Sleeve Baselayer $31.81 $42.50 $40.74

135 5.11 Performance Long Sleeve Polo $51.43 $44.20 $58.17
136 Under Armour Womens Coldgear $75.34 $46.75 $77.00

137 Under Armours Mens Coldgear $75.34 $46.75 $77.00
138 Carhartt Womens Relaxed Fit $68.49 $44.99 $69.99
139 LA Police Gear Stretch OPS $82.19 No Bid $64.99

* Any award shall be subject to the issuance of a purchase order or the execution of a contract between

the bidder and the County of Orange.

Samantha Sweikata

Commissioner of General Services

Denotes Award


